Janitorial Awarded Summary 2020 1st. qt.xls

Janitorial Supply Quote Summary
January 1, 2020 - March 31, 2020

Prison
CENTRAL POLY BAG CORP PRO SUPPLY Pyramid School Products STATE INDUSTRIAL PRODUCTS SUSQUEHANNA PAPER SANITARY SUPPLY W.B. Mason Co. Inc.
MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM
ITEM DESCRIPTION uNIT TEm# || UNIT cosT NOTES UNIT TEm# || UNIT cosT NOTES uNIT TEm# || UNIT cosT NOTES uNIT TEM# | UNIT cosT NOTES uNIT ITEM # UNIT cosT NOTES UNIT ITEM # UNIT cosT NOTES
SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING
7-7/8” x 1000 ft. Hard Wound White Roll Paper Towels 6/Case pr0se |[$ 1966 6/Case esoow s 1885 6/Case No Quote 6/Case No Quote 6/Case s |g 0 6/Case e | |s D
24x33 BMIC
i i I I i I
Can Liner (24 X 32 X 8 Micron HDPE) 50Bags/Roll 201l o) 1anne s 1000 S50Bags/Roll20fl 000y s 2550 50 Bags/Roll 20 No Quote 50 Bags/Roll 20 No Quote 50 Bags/Roll 20 50 Bags/Ro Natural / Black
Rolls/Case Rolls/Case Rolls/Case Rolls/Case Rolls/Case 20 Rolls/Case
BERR4  ||$ 31.48 HERZ4824LNROL || § 15.83|1000/Case
) : 25 Bags/Roll 10 25 Bags/Roll 10 25 Bags/Roll 10 25 Bags/Roll 10 25 Bags/Roll 10 25 Bags/Roll Natural/Black
Can Liner (40 x48 x 16 Micron HDPE) rlufcase || CPéose1s s 2200 s a04s16N || S 26.80 s No Quote P No Quote s o ey
BeRR12 |8 35.78 HERZ8048VNRO1 || $ 2284
Tollet Tissue 2 Ply 3.57x4.5” 500 sheet/foll >33lb./case > 545q 96/case 276 s 4260 96/case sgso6U  [[$ 3175 96/case No Quote 96/case No Quote 96/case susaizo ||s 3320 96/case am2zs s 3006

Vendor Contact Information:

Rep: Nicole Lawson
Phone: 908-862-7570
Fax: 908-862-9019
Email: bids@centralpoly.com

Rep: Anthony Delmastro
Phone: 570-659-1004
Fax: 570-300-3131
Email: prosupply26@yahoo.com

Rep: Kenneth Miller
Phone: 800-792-2644 ext 225
Fax: 813-621-7688
Email: biddept@pyramidsp.com
ORDERS MAY BE EMAILED TO: orders@pyramidsp.com

Rep: Jennifer Luckenbill
Phone: 570-337-8527
Fax: 888-771-9670
Email: jluckenbill@stateindustrial.com

Rep: Andy Silverstrim
Phone: 570-916-2047
Fax: 570-323-8514
Email: asilverstrim@susquehannapaper.com

Rep: Jared Lebo
Phone: 888-926-2766
Fax: 814-942-4858
Email: Jared.Lebo@wbmason.com

Prison



Janitorial Supply Quote Summary
January 1, 2020 - March 31, 2020
Resource Management Services

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP PRO SUPPLY STATE INDUSTRIAL PRODUCTS SUSQUEHANNA PAPER SANITARY SUPPLY W.B. MASON CO. Inc. PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS
MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT ITEM # UNIT COST UNIT ITEM # UNIT COST NOTES UNIT ITEM # UNIT COST NOTES UNIT ITEM # UNIT COST NOTES UNIT ITEM # UNIT COST NOTES UNIT ITEM # UNIT COST NOTES
SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING
12 OZ WHITE FOAM CUP 1000/CASE No Quote 1000/CASE No Quote 1000/CASE No Quote 1000/CASE BUN2272 $31.88 1000/CASE DCC12)16 $43.67 1000/CASE DCC12)12 $42.98
[9 OZ. COLD DRINK CUPS 2500/CASE No Quote 2500/CASE No Quote 2500/CASE No Quote 2500/CASE No Quote 2500/CASE BWKTRANSCUPSCT $40.53 2500/CASE BWISTRAN $69.98
[ANGLE SWEEP BROOM EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH WNCBRM60L $5.39 EACH BRIO24AMA $3.89 6/case Full Case Only
BLEND BUDDY FOR H20RANGE2 EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Bid EACH No Quote
[CAN LINERS 33" X 40" 33 GAL HI-D 16 MICRONS 250/CASE CP334016 $17.60 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE 250/CASE 250/CASE No Quote
BUN2510 $15.36 HERZ6640VNRO1 $15.72
[CAN LINERS 33" X 40" HI-D 16 MICRONS 250/CASE CP334016 $17.60 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE PAB;\IAOM No Quot 250/CASE HERZEE40VNROL $15.72 250/CASE No Quote
o Quote 66 N
[CASCADE LIQUID DISHWASHER DETERGENT 20 0Z/EA No Quote 20 0Z/EA No Quote 20 0Z/EA No Quote 20 0Z/EA No Quote 20 0Z/EA PGC28193 No Bid 20 0Z/EA PGC59061 $3.89 9/case Full Case Only
[CLEAR CAN LINERS 8-10 GALLON FOR #2956 CAN 250/CASE CP10GN No Quote 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE HERZ4824RNRO1 $11.69 1000/cs 250/CASE No Quote
DUST PANS 12" EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH RCP2005CHA $2.40 EACH FG2005 $1.79 rubber
DUST PANS 16" EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH COCP716 No Bid 12/cs EACH 4216 $6.79 steel
DUSTING BRUSHES 8” GRAY FIBER EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH BWK5408 $3.93 EACH 100 $1.98
EN MOTION ROLL TOWELS 6 ROLLS/CASE 8168 $55.00 6 ROLLS/CASE No Quote 6 ROLLS/CASE No Quote 6ROLLS/CASE [ ) anE130 $63.12 6 ROLLS/CASE GPCB9460 54985 6 ROLLS/CASE No Quote
IEN MOTION TOWEL DISPENSER EACH 1080E $60.00 EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH GPC59462A No Bid EACH No Quote
EXTEND TO REACH DUSTER EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH BWKL3850 $5.94 Lambswool EACH No Quote
FINISH MOP HEAD EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH BUNZ1016 No Quote EACH ABOLM203CSN24 $2.88 12/cs EACH LM203MCSNB $3.59 12/case Full Case Only
FURNITURE POLISH FOR WOOD/FORMICA/VINYL 12/CASE No Quote 12/CASE No Quote 12/CASE No Quote 12/CASE No Quote 12/CASE NCL2007 $30.85 12/CASE 4109 $30.79
[GARAGE PUSH BROOM WITH HANDLE (HEAVY DUTY) EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH EACH EACH BH12003+01101 $7.99
No Quote NO BID
H20RANGE2 CONCENTRATE CLEANER 4 GALLONS/CASE No Quote 4 GALLONS/CASE No Quote 4 GALLONS/CASE No Quote 4 GALLONS/CASE ENVIL $106.39 GALLDI:S CASE No Bid 4 GALLONS/CASE No Quote
- AGALLONS/CASE|
KIMBERLY CLARK KLEENEX C FOLD TOWEL WHITE 2400/CASE No Quote 2400/CASE No Quote 2400/CASE No Quote 2400/CASE KIMBS2 $34.96 2400/CASE GPC25190 $24.44 2400/CASE No Quote
KLING CLINGING TOILET BOWEL CLEANER 12 QUARTS/CASE No Quote 12 QUARTS/CASE No Quote 12 QUARTS/CASE No Quote 12 QUARTS/CASE BETC65 $23.38 Qu, 2 NLC1735 $20.12 12 QUARTS/CASE No Quote
LAMBS WOOL DUSTER EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH BWKL26 $3.80 26" EACH 524PPD $2.59
LIQUID DISHWASHING SOAP 50 0Z/6/CASE No Quote 50 0Z/6/CASE No Quote 50 0Z/6/CASE No Quote 50 0Z/6/CASE No Quote 50 0Z/6/CASE CPC49860 $25.80 50 0Z/6/CASE No Quote
GALLON/4/CAS|
LIQUID LAUNDRY DETERGENT GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE 117730 $46.80 GALLON/4/CASE No Quote £ BCC4750400 $52.39 GALLON/4/CASE No Quote
GALLON/4/CAS|
MAJESTIC EXTRACTION CLEANER GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE 121557 $80.80 GALLON/4/CASE No Quote £ NCL66029 $23.52 GALLON/4/CASE No Quote
GALLON/4/CAS|
MAJESTIC TRIPLE ACTION SPOTTER DEODORIZER GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote £ NCL67529 $24.48 GALLON/4/CASE No Quote
MULTIFOLD NATURAL PAPER TOWEL 4000/CASE P200N No Quote 4000/CASE No Quote 4000/CASE No Quote 4000/CASE SUSQ301 $14.20 4000/CASE MRCP200N $13.54 4000/CASE No Quote
PAIL PUMP EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH TOC160108 $1.24 EACH No Quote
[SCENTED HAND SOAP WITH LOTION 4 GALLON No Quote 4 GALLON No Quote 4 GALLON No Quote 4 GALLON No Quote 4 GALLON BWK420CT $15.27 4 GALLON No Quote
[SCOTT 10 WYPALL L40 WIPES CASE No Quote CASE No Quote CASE No Quote CASE SCOT10 $65.95 CASE KCCO5701 $53.04 CASE No Quote
[SCRUB BRUSH EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH RCP6482COB No Bid EACH 77 $1.29 Iron Style
[SCRUBBING SPONGES 6.1” X 3.6” 20/CASE No Quote 20/CASE No Quote 20/CASE No Quote 20/CASE No Quote 20/CASE BWK174 $10.86 20/CASE 70CHD-20 $12.98
SPONGES 51/4X35/8X11/2 6/CASE No Quote 6/CASE No Quote 6/CASE No Quote 6/CASE MICR143 $45.58 24/case 6/CASE BWKCS2 $4.50 24 CT 6/CASE WIPK $3.54
SPONGES 5 1/4 X 35/8 X 2 6/CASE No Quote 6/CASE No Quote 6/CASE No Quote 6/CASE No Quote 6/CASE BWKCS2 $4.50 24CT 6/CASE W2PK $4.74
[SPRAY NINE AEROSOL GLASS & STAINLESS CLEANER EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH NCL2002 $2.07 12ct EACH ITW2339 $4.59 6/case Full Case Only
TOILET BOWL CLEANER/BRUSH CADDIE EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH RCP631100WE $1.97 EACH 150 $1.98
TOILET BRUSH ANGLE HEAD EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH BWK6217 $2.53 EACH 17 $0.99
[TOILET BRUSH STRAIGHT HEAD EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH RCP6301000WE $1.42 EACH 6310 $1.19
TOILET TISSUE (JUMBO 9” 2-PLY WITH 3.3” CORE) 12/CASE A700 $22.00 12/CASE No Quote 12/CASE No Quote 12/CASE PEER9S $23.80 12/CASE ALIC410002 $17.09 12/CASE No Quote
[TOILET TISSUE 2-PLY SMALL 96/CASE A276 $42.00 96/CASE No Quote 96/CASE No Quote 96/CASE SUSQ103 $28.40 96/CASE ALM235 $27.92 96/CASE No Quote
URINAL BLOCK SCENTED WITH SCREEN EACH 12/pk No Quote EACH 12/pk No Quote EACH 12/pk 108201 $69.66 EACH 12/pk FRES9 $21.41 EACH 12/pk BWKNUS $12.42 EACH 12/pk 94805 $11.69
Rep: Nicole Lawson Rep: Anthony Delmastro Rep: Jennifer Luckenbill Rep: Andy Silverstrim Rep: Jared Lebo Rep: Kenny Miller
Phone: 908-862-7570 Phone: 570-659-1004 Phone: 570-337-8527 Phone: 570-916-2047 Phone: 888-926-2766 Phone: 813-621-6446
Vendor Contact Information: Fax: 908-862-9019 Fax: 570-300-3131 Fax: 888-771-9670 Fax: 570-323-8514 Fax: 814-942-4858 Fax: 813-621-7688
Email: bids@centralpoly.com Email: prosupply26@yahoo.com Email: jluckenbill@stateindustrial.com Email: asilverstrim@susquehannapaper.com Email: Jared.Lebo@wbmason.com Email: biddept@pyramidsp.com
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Janitorial Supply Quote Summary
January 1, 2020 - March 31, 2020
Courthouse, Executive Plaza, Third Street Plaza, Lysock View Complex & Pre-Release Center

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP PRO SUPPLY PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS STATE INDUSTRIAL PRODUCTS SUSQUEHANNA PAPER SANITARY SUPPLY W.B. MASON CO. Inc.
MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM
ITEM DESCRIPTION uNIT ITEM# | UNIT cOST NOTES uNIT ITEM # UNIT cOST NOTES UNIT ITEM # UNIT cOST NOTES UNIT ITEM# | UNIT COST NOTES UNIT ITEM # UNIT coST NOTES UNIT ITEM # UNIT coST NOTES
SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING
BROWN MULTIFOLD TOWELS MIN CASE WEIGHT 18.54 LBS 4000/CASE P200N $19.10 4000/CASE 200 $14.00 4000/CASE No Quote mim:\iﬂr;\o:rder 4000/CASE No Quote 1000/CASE 5USQ301 $14.20 4000/CASE MRCP200N $13.54
BROWN ROLL TOWELS 7 7/8"X600-2"CORE MIN CASE 6
EOHT 35 0185 NET w1 12 ROLLS/CASE P726N $20.80 12 ROLLS/CASE 126008 $25.40 12 ROLLS/CASE No Quote 12 ROLLS/CASE No Quote 2500/CASE S0 <2840 12ROLLS/CASE | ALICIK600 $22.83
[CAN LINER BAGS (24"X33") 8 MICRONS CASE WEIGHT- MIN 20 ROLLS/S0 20 ROLLS/S0 20 ROLLS/S0 20 ROLLS/S0 20 ROLLS/50
16.8 LBS NET WT. BAGS/CASE CP243308 $18.20 BAGS/CASE 24-33-8N $25.50 BAGS/CASE No Quote BAGS/CASE No Quote EACH i . BAGS/CASE HERZ4833LNRO1| $21.72 Black/Clear
#60917C/0OLYC( ¥
[CAN LINER BAGS (30"X37") 13MICRONS CASE WEIGHT -MIN 20 ROLLS/25 X 20ROLLS/25 s 20ROLLS/25 This number 20 ROLLS/25 20ROLLS/25 (| HERZ6037HNRO
o Lo nEr BAGS/CASE CP303713 $18.40 BAGS/CASE 3037-16N $27.80 BAGS/CASE NoQuote [\ must be fisted on BAGS/CASE No Quote EACH BAGS/CASE ; $2020 || Black/Clear
Il orders placed. BERR 11 $33.86
[CAN LINER BAGS (38"X60") 17 MICRONS CASE WEIGHT -MIN 8 ROLLS/25 8 ROLLS/25 8 ROLLS/25 8 ROLLS/25 8 ROLLS/25
0.9 LBS NET WT. BAGS/CASE CP386017 $19.80 BAGS/CASE No Quote BAGS/CASE No Quote BAGS/CASE No Quote 250/CASE T ) BAGS/CASE HERZ7660XNRO1| $22.96 Black/Clear
[CAN LINER BAGS (40"X48") 16 MICRONS CASE WEIGHT -MIN 10 ROLLS/25 P 10 ROLLS/25 10 ROLLS/25 10 ROLLS/25 10 ROLLS/25
o 165 Nervrr SAGS/ At cPavasis $23.00 SAGS/ At 40-48-16N $26.80 BAGY/CASE No Quote BAGY/CASE No Quote 250/cAse BAGY/CASE | $1536 [ Black/Clear
BERR 12 $35.78
|GLOVES-NITRILE- EMERALD EXAM P-FREE min 4mil-X LARGE 100BX/10BX/CASE No Quote 100BX/10BX/CASE NITXL $36.00 100BX/10BX/CASE | TRADEX #NXL400 $37.90 100BX/10BX/CASE No Quote 100BX/10BX/case| 100BX/10BX/CASE f| CSWNEBPFGXL $30.60
ZONE42 $45.87
(GLOVES-NITRILE- EMERALD EXAM P-FREE min 4mil- LARGE | 100BX/10BX/CASE No Quote 100BX/108X/CASE NITLG $36.00 1008X/108X/CASE | TRADEX #iNLGA00 | $37.90 100BX/108X/CASE No Quote 100BX/108Xcase] 100BX/108X/CASE || CSWNEBPFGL $30.60
0NE24 $45.87
GLOVES VINYL/POWDER FREE-EXAM QUALITY -5 MIL-XLARGE ooEN No Quote ooEN2 9709 $26.75 100 BX/10 BX/CASEf TRADEX #VXL5201 $23.90 100 BX/10 BX/CASE No Quote EACH TEETED CSWVECPFGXL $16.60
BX/CASE BX/CASE BX/CASE
BUNZ936 $28.21
[GLOVES VINYL/POWDER FREE-EXAM QUALITY-5MIL-LARGE 100 BX/10 No Quote 100 BX/10 9708 $26.75 100 BX/10 BX/CASEf TRADEX #VLG5201 $23.90 100 BX/10 BX/CASE No Quote EACH 100 6x/10 CSWVECPFGL $16.60
BX/CASE BX/CASE BX/CASE
BUNZ937 $2821
GOJO FOAM SOAP- LUXURY FOAM HANDWASH 2-1500ML/CASE No Quote 2-1500ML/CASE 8561 $44.00 2-1500ML/CASE No Quote 2-1500ML/CASE No Quote EACH No Quote 2-1500ML/CASE [ Gossse102CT NO BID
NEUTRAL FLOOR CLEANER CONCENTRATE- LEMON OR
NEUTAL St 4 GALLONS/CASE No Quote 4 GALLONS/CASE A7 $23.25 4 GALLONS/CASE No Quote 4 GALLONS/CASE | 121385 43053 6 ROLLS/CASE [ on7 4 GALLONS/CASE | NCL404829 $15.43
TOILET TISSUE (2-PLY 500 SHEETS-MIN 4.0"X3.5") -34.0 LBS
MIN CASE WT. 96 ROLL/CASE A276 $42.00 96 ROLL/CASE 58596V $31.75 96 ROLL/CASE No Quote 96 ROLL/CASE No Quote EACH SUsQ110 $33.24 96 ROLL/CASE ALM235 $30.06
TOILET TISSUE (2:PLY JUMBO JUNIOR ROLL'S" -1000FT/ROLL) |, oy 5/case A700 $22.00 12 ROLLS/CASE ™ $2090 12 ROLLS/CASE No Quote 12 ROLLS/CASE No Quote EACH 12ROLLS/CASE || ALICA10002 $17.00
22.0 LBS MIN CASE WT
PEERSS $23.80
WHITE ROLL TOWELS 7 7/8" X800'-2"DIA CORE-MIN CASE WT
P7088 6-800W MRCP7088 7
26.88 LBS. 6 ROLLS/CASE $19.66 6 ROLLS/CASE $18.85 6 ROLLS/CASE No Quote 6 ROLLS/CASE No Quote EACH SUSQ202 $19.10 6 ROLLS/CASE $17.87
Rep: Nicole Lawson Rep: Anthony Delmastro Rep: Kenneth Miller Rep: Jennifer Luckenbill Rep: Andy Silverstrim Rep: Jared Lebo
Phone: 908-862-7570 Phone: 570-659-1004 Phone: 813-621-6446 ext 225 Phone: 570-337-8527 Phone: 570-916-2047 Phone: 888-926-2766
Vendor Contact Information: Fax: 908-862-9019 Fax: 570-300-3131 Fax: 813-621-7688 Fax: 833-771-9670 Fax: 570-323-3189 Fax: 814-942-4858
ids@centralpoly.com Email: prosupply26@yahoo.com : biddept@pyramidsp.com Email: jluckenbill@stateindustrial.com Email: asilverstrim @susquehannapaper.com : Jared.Lebo@wbmason.com
ORDERS MAY BE EMAILED TO: orders@pyramidsp.com

Janitorial Awarded Summary 2020 1. is CHEP TSP LV & PRC



	Prison
	RMS
	CH EP TSP LV & PRC

