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ENVELOPES - BLANK & PREPRINTED QUOTE SUMMARY
January 1, 2020 - June 30, 2020

BLANK BLANK BLANK

ITEM DESCRIPTION Quantity
 Price Per 

1000 
 Price Per 

1000 
 Price Per Lot  Price Per 1000 

 Price Per 
1000 

 Price Per 
Lot 

 Price Per 1000 
 Price Per 

1000 
 Price Per Lot 

#9 Regular Envelopes - White 1,000 17.49$            66.00$             66.00$             NO BID 81.24$            81.24$        NO BID NO BID NO BID
#9 Regular Envelopes - White 2,500 17.49$            44.00$             110.00$          NO BID 54.38$            135.95$      19.15$                 56.20$             140.50$          
#9 Regular Envelopes - White 5,000 17.49$            39.50$             197.00$          NO BID 43.00$            215.00$      19.15$                 38.85$             194.25$          
#9 Regular Envelopes - White 7,500 17.49$            37.75$             283.00$          NO BID 39.76$            298.20$      19.15$                 33.60$             248.25$          
#9 Regular Envelopes - White 10,000 17.49$            35.00$             350.00$          NO BID 37.47$            374.70$      18.80$                 30.20$             302.00$          
#9 Regular Envelopes - White 25,000 17.49$            29.00$             725.00$          NO BID 29.91$            747.75$      18.70$                 23.80$             395.00$          
#9 Regular Envelopes - White 50,000 17.49$            25.50$             382.50$          NO BID 24.33$            1,216.50$   18.65$                 20.35$             1,017.50$       

NO BID
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 1,000 17.49$            64.50$             64.50$             NO BID 81.79$            81.79$        NO BID NO BID NO BID
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 2,500 17.49$            43.50$             108.75$          NO BID 55.57$            138.93$      19.15$                 63.00$             157.50$          
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 5,000 17.49$            38.50$             192.50$          NO BID 43.49$            217.45$      19.15$                 44.60$             223.00$          
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 7,500 17.49$            37.00$             277.50$          NO BID 39.81$            298.58$      19.15$                 38.45$             288.38$          
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 10,000 17.49$            39.00$             390.00$          NO BID 37.50$            375.00$      18.80$                 35.40$             354.00$          
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 25,000 17.49$            31.50$             787.50$          NO BID 29.91$            747.75$      18.70$                 28.65$             716.25$          
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 50,000 17.49$            26.00$             1,300.00$       NO BID 24.27$            1,213.50$   18.65$                 24.10$             1,205.00$       

NO BID
#10 Window Envelopes - White 1,000 21.00$            66.00$             66.00$             NO BID 85.69$            85.69$        NO BID NO BID NO BID
#10 Window Envelopes - White 2,500 21.00$            45.00$             112.50$          NO BID 57.68$            144.20$      21.15$                 64.60$             161.50$          
#10 Window Envelopes - White 5,000 21.00$            40.00$             200.00$          NO BID 45.57$            227.85$      21.15$                 46.20$             231.00$          
#10 Window Envelopes - White 7,500 21.00$            39.00$             292.50$          NO BID 41.49$            311.18$      21.15$                 40.10$             300.75$          
#10 Window Envelopes - White 10,000 21.00$            34.00$             340.00$          NO BID 39.56$            395.60$      20.80$                 37.00$             370.00$          
#10 Window Envelopes - White 25,000 21.00$            34.00$             850.00$          NO BID 31.22$            180.50$      20.70$                 30.30$             757.50$          
#10 Window Envelopes - White 50,000 21.00$            31.00$             1,550.00$       NO BID 26.00$            1,300.00$   20.65$                 25.60$             1,280.00$       

NO BID
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White 1,000 33.50$            102.00$          112.00$          NO BID 114.80$          114.80$      NO BID NO BID NO BID
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White 2,500 33.50$            72.00$             180.00$          NO BID 90.10$            225.25$      34.15$                 77.15$             192.88$          
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White 5,000 33.50$            63.00$             315.00$          NO BID 77.39$            386.95$      34.15$                 61.20$             306.00$          
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White 7,500 33.50$            63.00$             472.50$          NO BID 73.03$            547.73$      34.15$                 52.25$             391.88$          
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White 10,000 33.50$            60.00$             600.00$          NO BID 71.09$            710.90$      34.00$                 49.15$             491.50$          
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White 25,000 33.50$            54.00$             1,350.00$       NO BID 60.92$            1,523.00$   31.80$                 42.35$             1,058.75$       
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White 50,000 33.50$            47.00$             2,350.00$       NO BID 55.28$            2,764.00$   30.60$                 38.20$             1,910.00$       

NO BID
#10 Regular Envelopes - Ivory 1,000 36.50$            68.00$             68.00$             NO BID 251.42$          251.42$      NO BID NO BID NO BID
#10 Regular Envelopes - Ivory 2,500 29.50$            46.00$             115.00$          NO BID 164.52$          411.30$      24.70$                 67.95$             169.88$          
#10 Regular Envelopes - Ivory 5,000 29.50$            41.00$             205.00$          NO BID 132.92$          664.60$      24.70$                 49.55$             247.75$          
#10 Regular Envelopes - Ivory 7,500 29.50$            40.00$             300.00$          NO BID 132.62$          994.65$      24.70$                 43.40$             325.50$          
#10 Regular Envelopes - Ivory 10,000 30.00$            39.00$             390.00$          NO BID 128.65$          1,286.50$   24.50$                 40.35$             403.50$          
#10 Regular Envelopes - Ivory 25,000 28.00$            35.50$             887.50$          NO BID 94.28$            2,357.00$   22.90$                 34.80$             870.00$          
#10 Regular Envelopes - Ivory 50,000 24.50$            32.00$             1,600.00$       NO BID 86.71$            4,335.50$   21.70$                 28.70$             1,435.00$       

6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 1,000 25.50$            88.00$             88.00$             NO BID 202.61$          202.61$      31.15$                 NO BID NO BID
6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 2,500 25.50$            72.00$             180.00$          NO BID 111.99$          279.98$      31.15$                 74.30$             185.75$          
6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 5,000 25.50$            57.00$             285.00$          NO BID 91.08$            455.40$      31.00$                 55.15$             275.75$          
6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 7,500 25.50$            54.00$             405.00$          NO BID 72.61$            544.58$      29.55$                 49.30$             369.75$          
6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 10,000 25.50$            48.00$             480.00$          NO BID 63.38$            633.80$      29.55$                 46.35$             463.50$          
6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 25,000 25.50$            44.00$             1,100.00$       NO BID 42.25$            1,056.25$   24.70$                 36.70$             917.50$          
6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 50,000 25.50$            38.00$             1,400.00$       NO BID 36.60$            1,830.00$   23.05$                 32.80$             1,640.00$       

Vendor Contact Information:

 6x9 Booklets 
are packed 1m 

per carton - 
must order in 
increments of 

1m, can't break 
cartons. 

Fax: 214-973-5499

Email: Jaydengraphicsives01@gmail.com

REP: Jeff Henson
Phone: 800-334-7026  

Fax: 800-622-3329

Email:  Jeff.Henson@macpapers.com

MAC Paper Converters

PRE-PRINTED

Jayden Graphics Inc.

Rep:  Chase Pelley
Phone: 603-361-5501

Fax: 800-891-5154

Rep:  Craig Martin
Phone: 972-838-2000

 Shipping / 
Minimum 

Orders 

PRE-PRINTED

Dunbar Security Products

PRE-PRINTED

Email: 
chase.pelly@dunbarsecurityproducts.com
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